
CITY OF MERCER ISLAND
Mercer Island Open Space Restoration 2024  24-19
SUMMARY OF BID RESULTS

BID OPENING: date:April 10, 2024  time:1:00 PM (submitted electronically to bids@mercerisland.gov)

PARK Applied Ecology Hanson Tree Service Olson Environmental LOWEST BIDDER / CONTRACT AWARD
Homestead 26,387.10$        38,397.60$               14,777.48$               Not Awarded
Island Crest Park 4,399.10$          8,593.92$                 8,614.67$                 Applied Ecology
Luther Burbank No Bid 22,562.33$               30,271.06$               Hanson
Mercerdale Hillside No Bid 47,181.80$               46,743.60$               Olson
North Mercerdale 21,231.00$        15,200.14$               21,789.07$               Hanson
Pioneer Park NE No Bid 43,123.85$               54,464.64$               Hanson
Pioneer Park NW 16,461.60$        17,933.00$               14,211.77$               Olson
Pioneer Park SE 29,420.10$        24,406.91$               55,425.89$               Hanson
SE 47th No Bid 7,278.38$                 4,263.53$                 Olson
Upper Luther No Bid 35,000.00$               46,774.66$               Hanson

Bids (pre-tax)


